F:\MI12\HOLT\HOLT_045.XML

AMENDMENT TO H.R. 754, AS REPORTED

OFFERED BY MR. HOLT OF NEW JERSEY

At the end of title III, add the following new section:

1 SEC. 304. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS FOR NA-

2 TIONAL SECURITY EDUCATION PROGRAM.

3 The David 1i. Boren National Security Education Act
4 of 1991 (50 U.S.C. 1901 et seq.) is amended—

5 (1) in section 810(e), by striking “$8,000,000”
6 and inserting “$16,000,000"’;

7 (2) in section 811—

8 (A) in subsection (a), by striking
9 “$10,000,000” and inserting “$20,000,000";
10 and

11 (B) in  subsection (b), by striking
12 “$6,000,000” and inserting “$12,000,000;
13 and

14 (3) in section 812(1), by striking “$2,000,000”
15 and inserting “$4,000,000".

fA\VHLC\050911\050911.431.xml
May 9, 2011 (7:42 p.m.)

(49655311)



