G:\M\INSUOZZIN\SUOZZI_024. XML

AMENDMENT TO THE SENATE AMENDMENT TO
HR. 1

OFFERED BY MR. SU0ZZI OF NEW YORK

Amend section 70101 by inserting the following new

subsection after subsection (b):

1 (¢) APPLICATION OF 39.6 PERCENT RATE.—Section
2 1(j) is amended by adding at the end the following new
3 paragraph:
4 “(7) APPLICATION OF 39.6 PERCENT RATE.—In
5 the case of any taxable year beginning after Decem-
6 ber 31, 2025, the Secretary shall modify the tables
7 contained in paragraph (2) such that—
8 “(A) 1n the case of the table contained in
9 subparagraph (A) thereof, a 39.6 percent rate
10 of tax applies to taxable income in excess of
11 $500,000,
12 “(B) 1n the case of the table contained in
13 subparagraph (B) thereof, a 39.6 percent rate
14 of tax applies to taxable income in excess of
15 $425,000,
16 “(C) in the case of the table contained in
17 subparagraph (C) thereof, a 39.6 percent rate
g:\V\G\070125\G070125.036.xm (100109911)

July 1, 2025 (2:16 p.m.)



G:\M\INSUOZZIN\SUOZZI_024. XML

2

[E—

of tax applies to taxable income in excess of
$400,000,

“(D) in the case of the table contained in
subparagraph (D) thereof, a 39.6 percent rate
of tax applies to taxable income in excess of
$225,000, and

“(E) in the case of the table contained in

subparagraph (E) thereof, a 39.6 percent rate

O o0 9 AN U B~ W

of tax applies to taxable income in excess of

$20,000".

[a—
S

Amend section 70120(a)(2) to read as follows:

11 (2) by striking “$10,000 ($5,000” and insert-
12 ing “$80,000 ($40,000".

Amend section 70120 by striking subsection (b).

g:\V\G\070125\G070125.036.xml (100109911)
July 1, 2025 (2:16 p.m.)




Amendment to the Senate amendment to H.R. 1 


Offered by Mr. Suozzi of New York


Amend section 70101 by inserting the following new subsection after subsection (b):


(c) Application of 39.6 percent rate.—Section 1(j) is amended by adding at the end the following new paragraph:

“(7) APPLICATION OF 39.6 PERCENT RATE.—In the case of any taxable year beginning after December 31, 2025, the Secretary shall modify the tables contained in paragraph (2) such that— 


“(A) in the case of the table contained in subparagraph (A) thereof, a 39.6 percent rate of tax applies to taxable income in excess of $500,000,


“(B) in the case of the table contained in subparagraph (B) thereof, a 39.6 percent rate of tax applies to taxable income in excess of $425,000,


“(C) in the case of the table contained in subparagraph (C) thereof, a 39.6 percent rate of tax applies to taxable income in excess of $400,000,


“(D) in the case of the table contained in subparagraph (D) thereof, a 39.6 percent rate of tax applies to taxable income in excess of $225,000, and


“(E) in the case of the table contained in subparagraph (E) thereof, a 39.6 percent rate of tax applies to taxable income in excess of $20,000”.


Amend section 70120(a)(2) to read as follows:


(2) by striking “$10,000 ($5,000” and inserting “$80,000 ($40,000”. 

Amend section 70120 by striking subsection (b).



  
   G:\M\19\SUOZZI\SUOZZI_024.XML XXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXX 7/1/2025 14:16 XXXXXXXXXXX 07/01/2025 2:08 PM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXX   1001099|1  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
  
 
  
  
 119th CONGRESS  1st Session 
 Amendment to the Senate amendment to H.R. 1  
  
 Offered by  Mr. Suozzi of New York 
  
 
 
    
  Amend section 70101 by inserting the following new subsection after subsection (b):
 
  (c) Application of 39.6 percent rate Section 1(j) is amended by adding at the end the following new paragraph:
 
  (7) Application of 39.6 percent rate In the case of any taxable year beginning after December 31, 2025, the Secretary shall modify the tables contained in paragraph (2) such that—
  (A) in the case of the table contained in subparagraph (A) thereof, a 39.6 percent rate of tax applies to taxable income in excess of $500,000,
  (B) in the case of the table contained in subparagraph (B) thereof, a 39.6 percent rate of tax applies to taxable income in excess of $425,000,
  (C) in the case of the table contained in subparagraph (C) thereof, a 39.6 percent rate of tax applies to taxable income in excess of $400,000,
  (D) in the case of the table contained in subparagraph (D) thereof, a 39.6 percent rate of tax applies to taxable income in excess of $225,000, and
  (E) in the case of the table contained in subparagraph (E) thereof, a 39.6 percent rate of tax applies to taxable income in excess of $20,000 .
 
  Amend section 70120(a)(2) to read as follows:
 
  (2) by striking  $10,000 ($5,000 and inserting  $80,000 ($40,000. 
 
  Amend section 70120 by striking subsection (b). 

