G:\M\INSCOTAU\SCOTAU_136. XML

AMENDMENT TO RULES COMMITTEE PRINT 119-
33

OFFERED BY MR. AUSTIN SCOTT OF GEORGIA

At the end of subtitle A of title XXVIII, insert the

following new section:

1 SEC. 28 . INCREASE IN MILITARY CONSTRUCTION
PROJECT THRESHOLD FOR INCLUSION IN
PROJECT SPENDING PLAN.
Section 2865 of title 10, United States Code, is
amended by striking “$90,000,000” and inserting
“$125,000,000".

AN W B~ W

g:\V\E\062226\E062226.021.xml (107821411)
June 22, 2026 (11:10 a.m.)




Amendment to Rules Committee Print 119–33


Offered by Mr. Austin Scott of Georgia


At the end of subtitle A of title XXVIII, insert the following new section:


SEC. 28__. Increase in military construction project threshold for inclusion in project spending plan.

Section 2865 of title 10, United States Code, is amended by striking “$90,000,000” and inserting “$125,000,000”.



  
   G:\M\19\SCOTAU\SCOTAU_136.XML XXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXX 6/22/2026 11:09 XXXXXX 06/22/2026 11:07 AM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXX   1078214|1  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
  
 
  
  
 119th CONGRESS  2d Session 
 Amendment to Rules Committee Print 119–33 
  
 Offered by  Mr. Austin Scott of Georgia 
  
 
 
    
  At the end of subtitle A of title XXVIII, insert the following new section:
 
  28__. Increase in military construction project threshold for inclusion in project spending plan Section 2865 of title 10, United States Code, is amended by striking  $90,000,000 and inserting  $125,000,000.
 

