
AMENDMENT TO RULES COMM. PRINT 118–36 

OFFERED BY MR. AUSTIN SCOTT OF GEORGIA 

At the end of subtitle C of title XII, add the fol-

lowing: 

SEC. 17l. MODIFICATION OF STOCKPILING OF DEFENSE 1

ARTICLES FOR FOREIGN COUNTRIES. 2

Section 514(b)(2) of the Foreign Assistance Act of 3

1961 (22 U.S.C. 2321h(b)(2)) is amended— 4

(1) in subparagraph (A), by striking 5

‘‘$500,000,000’’ and inserting ‘‘$750,000,000’’; and 6

(2) in subparagraph (B), by striking 7

‘‘$200,000,000’’ and inserting ‘‘$400,000,000’’. 8

◊ 

VerDate Nov 24 2008 00:28 Jun 05, 2024 Jkt 000000 PO 00000 Frm 00001 Fmt 6652 Sfmt 6301 C:\USERS\MASYNNES\APPDATA\ROAMING\SOFTQUAD\XMETAL\11.0\GEN\C\SCOTAU_
June 5, 2024 (12:28 a.m.)

G:\M\18\SCOTAU\SCOTAU_080.XML

g:\V\G\060524\G060524.002.xml           (932443|1)



Amendment to Rules Comm. Print 118–36


Offered by Mr. Austin Scott of Georgia


At the end of subtitle C of title XII, add the following:


SEC. 17_. Modification of stockpiling of defense articles for foreign countries.

Section 514(b)(2) of the Foreign Assistance Act of 1961 (22 U.S.C. 2321h(b)(2)) is amended—


(1) in subparagraph (A), by striking “$500,000,000” and inserting “$750,000,000”; and


(2) in subparagraph (B), by striking “$200,000,000” and inserting “$400,000,000”. 



  
   G:\M\18\SCOTAU\SCOTAU_080.XML XXXXXXXX XXXXXXXX 6/5/2024 0:27 XXXXXXXX 06/05/2024 12:22 AM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXX   932443|1  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
  
 
  
  
 118th CONGRESS  2d Session 
 Amendment to Rules Comm. Print 118–36 
  
 Offered by  Mr. Austin Scott of Georgia 
  
 
 
    
  At the end of subtitle C of title XII, add the following:
 
  17_. Modification of stockpiling of defense articles for foreign countries Section 514(b)(2) of the Foreign Assistance Act of 1961 (22 U.S.C. 2321h(b)(2)) is amended—
  (1) in subparagraph (A), by striking  $500,000,000 and inserting  $750,000,000; and
  (2) in subparagraph (B), by striking  $200,000,000 and inserting  $400,000,000. 
 

