
AMENDMENT TO RULES COMMITTEE PRINT 118– 

36 

OFFERED BY MS. SALAZAR OF FLORIDA 

At the end of subtitle F of title VIII, insert the fol-

lowing new section: 

SEC. 8ll. AMENDMENTS TO CONTRACTING AUTHORITY 1

FOR CERTAIN SMALL BUSINESS CONCERNS. 2

(a) SOCIALLY AND ECONOMICALLY DISADVANTAGED 3

SMALL BUSINESS CONCERNS.—Section 8(a)(1)(D)(i)(II) 4

of the Small Business Act (15 U.S.C. 637(a)(1)(D)(i)(II)) 5

is amended— 6

(1) by striking ‘‘$7,000,000’’ and inserting 7

‘‘$10,000,000’’; and 8

(2) by striking ‘‘$3,000,000’’ and inserting 9

‘‘$8,000,000’’. 10

(b) CERTAIN SMALL BUSINESS CONCERNS OWNED 11

AND CONTROLLED BY WOMEN.—Section 8(m) of the 12

Small Business Act (15 U.S.C. 637(m)) is amended— 13

(1) in paragraph (7)(B)— 14

(A) in clause (i), by striking ‘‘$7,000,000’’ 15

and inserting ‘‘$10,000,000’’; and 16

(B) in clause (ii), by striking ‘‘$4,000,000’’ 17

and inserting ‘‘$8,000,000’’; and 18

VerDate Nov 24 2008 10:48 May 29, 2024 Jkt 000000 PO 00000 Frm 00001 Fmt 6652 Sfmt 6201 C:\USERS\SLWALKER\APPDATA\ROAMING\SOFTQUAD\XMETAL\11.0\GEN\C\SALAFL_0
May 29, 2024 (10:48 a.m.)

G:\M\18\SALAFL\SALAFL_063.XML

g:\V\H\052924\H052924.003.xml           (929748|2)



2 

(2) in paragraph (8)(B)— 1

(A) in clause (i), by striking ‘‘$7,000,000’’ 2

and inserting ‘‘$10,000,000’’; and 3

(B) in clause (ii), by striking ‘‘$4,000,000’’ 4

and inserting ‘‘$8,000,000’’. 5

(c) QUALIFIED HUBZONE SMALL BUSINESS CON-6

CERNS.—Section 31(c)(2)(A)(ii) of the Small Business 7

Act (15 U.S.C. 657a(c)(2)(A)(ii)) is amended— 8

(1) in subclause (I), by striking ‘‘$7,000,000’’ 9

and inserting ‘‘$10,000,000’’; and 10

(2) in subclause (II), by striking ‘‘$3,000,000’’ 11

and inserting ‘‘$8,000,000’’. 12

(d) SMALL BUSINESS CONCERNS OWNED AND CON-13

TROLLED BY SERVICE-DISABLED VETERANS.—Section 14

36(c)(2) of the Small Business Act (15 U.S.C. 657f) is 15

amended— 16

(1) in subparagraph (A), by striking 17

‘‘$7,000,000’’ and inserting ‘‘$10,000,000’’; and 18

(2) in subparagraph (B), by striking 19

‘‘$3,000,000’’ and inserting ‘‘$8,000,000’’. 20

(e) CERTAIN VETERAN-OWNED CONCERNS.—Section 21

8127(c) of title 38, United States Code, is amended by 22

striking ‘‘$5,000,000’’ and inserting ‘‘the dollar thresholds 23

under section 36(c)(2)(A) of the Small Business Act’’. 24

◊ 

VerDate Nov 24 2008 10:48 May 29, 2024 Jkt 000000 PO 00000 Frm 00002 Fmt 6652 Sfmt 6301 C:\USERS\SLWALKER\APPDATA\ROAMING\SOFTQUAD\XMETAL\11.0\GEN\C\SALAFL_0
May 29, 2024 (10:48 a.m.)

G:\M\18\SALAFL\SALAFL_063.XML

g:\V\H\052924\H052924.003.xml           (929748|2)



Amendment to Rules Committee Print 118–36


Offered by Ms. Salazar of Florida


At the end of subtitle F of title VIII, insert the following new section:


SEC. 8__. Amendments to contracting authority for certain small business concerns.

(a) Socially and economically disadvantaged small business concerns.—Section 8(a)(1)(D)(i)(II) of the Small Business Act (15 U.S.C. 637(a)(1)(D)(i)(II)) is amended— 


(1) by striking “$7,000,000” and inserting “$10,000,000”; and


(2) by striking “$3,000,000” and inserting “$8,000,000”.


(b) Certain small business concerns owned and controlled by women.—Section 8(m) of the Small Business Act (15 U.S.C. 637(m)) is amended— 


(1) in paragraph (7)(B)— 


(A) in clause (i), by striking “$7,000,000” and inserting “$10,000,000”; and


(B) in clause (ii), by striking “$4,000,000” and inserting “$8,000,000”; and


(2) in paragraph (8)(B)— 


(A) in clause (i), by striking “$7,000,000” and inserting “$10,000,000”; and


(B) in clause (ii), by striking “$4,000,000” and inserting “$8,000,000”.


(c) Qualified HUBZone small business concerns.—Section 31(c)(2)(A)(ii) of the Small Business Act (15 U.S.C. 657a(c)(2)(A)(ii)) is amended— 


(1) in subclause (I), by striking “$7,000,000” and inserting “$10,000,000”; and


(2) in subclause (II), by striking “$3,000,000” and inserting “$8,000,000”.


(d) Small business concerns owned and controlled by service-Disabled veterans.—Section 36(c)(2) of the Small Business Act (15 U.S.C. 657f) is amended— 


(1) in subparagraph (A), by striking “$7,000,000” and inserting “$10,000,000”; and


(2) in subparagraph (B), by striking “$3,000,000” and inserting “$8,000,000”.


(e) Certain veteran-Owned concerns.—Section 8127(c) of title 38, United States Code, is amended by striking “$5,000,000” and inserting “the dollar thresholds under section 36(c)(2)(A) of the Small Business Act”.



  
   G:\M\18\SALAFL\SALAFL_063.XML XXXXXXXX XXXXXXXX 5/29/2024 10:47 XXXXXXXXXXX 05/29/2024 10:29 AM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXX 
  929748|2
  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
  
 
  
  
 118th CONGRESS  2d Session 
 Amendment to Rules Committee Print 118–36 
  
 Offered by  Ms. Salazar of Florida 
  
 
 
    
  At the end of subtitle F of title VIII, insert the following new section: 
  
  8__. Amendments to contracting authority for certain small business concerns 
  (a) Socially and economically disadvantaged small business concerns Section 8(a)(1)(D)(i)(II) of the Small Business Act (15 U.S.C. 637(a)(1)(D)(i)(II)) is amended— 
  (1) by striking  $7,000,000 and inserting  $10,000,000; and 
  (2) by striking  $3,000,000 and inserting  $8,000,000. 
  (b) Certain small business concerns owned and controlled by women Section 8(m) of the Small Business Act (15 U.S.C. 637(m)) is amended— 
  (1) in paragraph (7)(B)— 
  (A) in clause (i), by striking  $7,000,000 and inserting  $10,000,000; and 
  (B) in clause (ii), by striking  $4,000,000 and inserting  $8,000,000; and 
  (2) in paragraph (8)(B)— 
  (A) in clause (i), by striking  $7,000,000 and inserting  $10,000,000; and 
  (B) in clause (ii), by striking  $4,000,000 and inserting  $8,000,000. 
  (c) Qualified HUBZone small business concerns Section 31(c)(2)(A)(ii) of the Small Business Act (15 U.S.C. 657a(c)(2)(A)(ii)) is amended— 
  (1) in subclause (I), by striking  $7,000,000 and inserting  $10,000,000; and 
  (2) in subclause (II), by striking  $3,000,000 and inserting  $8,000,000. 
  (d) Small business concerns owned and controlled by service-Disabled veterans Section 36(c)(2) of the Small Business Act (15 U.S.C. 657f) is amended— 
  (1) in subparagraph (A), by striking  $7,000,000 and inserting  $10,000,000; and 
  (2) in subparagraph (B), by striking  $3,000,000 and inserting  $8,000,000. 
  (e) Certain veteran-Owned concerns Section 8127(c) of title 38, United States Code, is amended by striking  $5,000,000 and inserting  the dollar thresholds under section 36(c)(2)(A) of the Small Business Act. 
 

