
AMENDMENT TO RULES COMMITTEE PRINT 

119–22 

OFFERED BY MS. PLASKETT OF VIRGIN ISLANDS 

At the end of title IV add the following: 

SEC. 4ll. MICRO-GRANTS FOR FOOD SECURITY. 1

Section 4206 of the Agriculture Improvement Act of 2

2018 (7 U.S.C. 7518) is amended— 3

(1) in subsection (e)(1)(A)— 4

(A) in clause (i), by striking ‘‘$5,000’’ and 5

inserting ‘‘$10,000’’; and 6

(B) in clause (ii), by striking ‘‘$10,000’’ 7

and inserting ‘‘$15,000’’; and 8

(2) in subsection (g)(1), by striking 9

‘‘$10,000,000’’ and inserting ‘‘$20,000,000’’. 10

◊ 

VerDate Nov 24 2008 12:37 Apr 21, 2026 Jkt 000000 PO 00000 Frm 00001 Fmt 6652 Sfmt 6301 C:\USERS\KCSWISS\APPDATA\ROAMING\SOFTQUAD\XMETAL\11.0\GEN\C\PLASKE_051
April 21, 2026 (12:37 p.m.)

G:\M\19\PLASKE\PLASKE_051.XML

g:\V\G\042126\g042126.006.xml           (1056993|1)



Amendment to Rules Committee Print


119–22


Offered by Ms. Plaskett of Virgin Islands


At the end of title IV add the following: 


SEC. 4__. Micro-grants for food security.

Section 4206 of the Agriculture Improvement Act of 2018 (7 U.S.C. 7518) is amended—


(1) in subsection (e)(1)(A)— 


(A) in clause (i), by striking “$5,000” and inserting “$10,000”; and 


(B) in clause (ii), by striking “$10,000” and inserting “$15,000”; and


(2) in subsection (g)(1), by striking “$10,000,000” and inserting “$20,000,000”. 



  
   G:\M\19\PLASKE\PLASKE_051.XML XXXXXXX XXXXXXX 4/21/2026 12:36 XXXXXXX 04/21/2026 12:29 PM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXX   1056993|1  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
  
 
  
  
 119th CONGRESS  2d Session 
 Amendment to Rules Committee Print 
 
 119–22 
 Offered by  Ms. Plaskett of Virgin Islands 
  
 
 
    
  At the end of title IV add the following: 
 
  4__. Micro-grants for food security Section 4206 of the Agriculture Improvement Act of 2018 (7 U.S.C. 7518) is amended—
  (1) in subsection (e)(1)(A)—
  (A) in clause (i), by striking  $5,000 and inserting  $10,000; and 
  (B) in clause (ii), by striking  $10,000 and inserting  $15,000; and
  (2) in subsection (g)(1), by striking  $10,000,000 and inserting  $20,000,000. 
 

