G:\M\17\MFUME\MFUME_003.XML
Rules #138 - Revised

AMENDMENT TO RULES COMMITTEE PRINT 117-
13

OFFERED BY MR. MFUME OF MARYLAND

At the end of subtitle E of title VIII, add the fol-

lowing new section:

1 SEC. 8 . MODIFICATIONS TO GOVERNMENTWIDE GOALS

2 FOR SMALL BUSINESS CONCERNS.

3 Section 15(2)(1)(A) of the Small Business Act (15
4 U.S.C. 644(2)(1)) i1s amended—

5 (1) in clause (i), by striking “23 percent” and
6 inserting ‘25 percent’’;

7 (2) in clause (ii), by striking “3 percent” and
8 inserting “‘4 percent’’;

9 (3) in clause (iii), by striking “3 percent” and
10 inserting ‘4 percent’’;
11 (4) in clause (iv), by striking “at not less than”
12 and all that follows and inserting the following: “‘at
13 not less than—
14 “(I) 11 percent of the total value
15 of all prime contract and subcontract
16 awards for fiscal year 2022;

g:\VHLD\092021\D092021.021.xm (82003014)

September 20, 2021 (10:26 a.m.)



G:\M\17\MFUME\MFUME_003.XML
Rules #138 - Revised

O o0 N N W BB W

e T SO =
W NN = O

2
“(IT) 12 percent of the total

value of all prime contract and sub-
contract awards for fiscal year 2023;

“(III) 13 percent of the total
value of all prime contract and sub-
contract awards for fiscal year 2024;
and

“(IV) 15 percent of the total
value of all prime contract and sub-
contract awards for fiscal year 2025

and each fiscal year thereafter.”; and

(5) in clause (v), by striking “at not less than”

and all that follows and inserting the following: “‘at

14 not less than—

15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22

g:\VHLD\092021\D092021.021.xml
September 20, 2021 (10:26 a.m.)

(82003014)

“(I) 6 percent of the total value
of all prime contract and subcontract
awards for each of fiscal years 2022
and 2023; and

“(IT) 7 percent of the total value
of all prime contract and subcontract
awards for fiscal year 2024 and each
fiscal year thereafter.”.




  
   G:\M\17\MFUME\MFUME_003.XML XXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXX 9/20/2021 10:25 XXXXXXX 09/13/2021 2:25 PM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXX 
  820030|4
  
 XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX 
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
  
 
  
  
 117th CONGRESS  1st Session 
 Amendment to Rules Committee Print 117–13 
  
 Offered by  Mr. Mfume of Maryland 
  
 
 
    
  At the end of subtitle E of title VIII, add the following new section: 
  
  8__. Modifications to Governmentwide goals for small business concerns Section 15(g)(1)(A) of the Small Business Act (15 U.S.C. 644(g)(1)) is amended— 
  (1) in clause (i), by striking  23 percent and inserting  25 percent; 
  (2) in clause (ii), by striking  3 percent and inserting  4 percent; 
  (3) in clause (iii), by striking  3 percent and inserting  4 percent;  
  (4) in clause (iv), by striking  at not less than and all that follows and inserting the following: 
  at not less than— 
  (I) 11 percent of the total value of all prime contract and subcontract awards for fiscal year 2022; 
  (II) 12 percent of the total value of all prime contract and subcontract awards for fiscal year 2023; 
  (III) 13 percent of the total value of all prime contract and subcontract awards for fiscal year 2024; and 
  (IV) 15 percent of the total value of all prime contract and subcontract awards for fiscal year 2025 and each fiscal year thereafter. ; and 
  (5) in clause (v), by striking  at not less than and all that follows and inserting the following: 
  at not less than— 
  (I) 6 percent of the total value of all prime contract and subcontract awards for each of fiscal years 2022 and 2023; and 
  (II) 7 percent of the total value of all prime contract and subcontract awards for fiscal year 2024 and each fiscal year thereafter. . 
 

