
AMENDMENT TO RULES COMM. PRINT 118–36 

OFFERED BY MR. MCGOVERN OF 

MASSACHUSETTS 

At the end of subtitle A of title XII, add the fol-

lowing new section: 

SEC. 12ll. EXTENSION OF AUTHORITIES TO IMPOSE SANC-1

TIONS UNDER CERTAIN LAWS RELATING TO 2

HONG KONG, TIBET, AND THE XINJIANG 3

UYGHUR AUTONOMOUS REGION. 4

(a) HONG KONG HUMAN RIGHTS AND DEMOCRACY 5

ACT OF 2019.—Section 7(h) of the Hong Kong Human 6

Rights and Democracy Act of 2019 (22 U.S.C. 5701 note) 7

is amended by striking ‘‘5 years’’ and inserting ‘‘10 8

years’’. 9

(b) AN ACT TO PROHIBIT THE COMMERCIAL EXPORT 10

OF COVERED MUNITIONS ITEMS TO THE HONG KONG PO-11

LICE FORCE.—Section 3 of the Act entitled ‘‘An Act to 12

prohibit the commercial export of covered munitions items 13

to the Hong Kong Police Force’’, approved November 27, 14

2019 (Public Law 116–77; 133 Stat. 1173), is amended 15

by striking ‘‘December 31, 2024’’ and inserting ‘‘Decem-16

ber 31, 2029’’. 17

VerDate Nov 24 2008 12:44 May 31, 2024 Jkt 000000 PO 00000 Frm 00001 Fmt 6652 Sfmt 6201 C:\USERS\XGSARMIENTO\APPDATA\ROAMING\SOFTQUAD\XMETAL\11.0\GEN\C\MCGO
May 31, 2024 (12:44 p.m.)

G:\M\18\MCGOVE\MCGOVE_060.XML

g:\VHLD\053124\D053124.077.xml           (931602|1)



2 

(c) RECIPROCAL ACCESS TO TIBET ACT OF 2018.— 1

The Reciprocal Access to Tibet Act of 2018 (Public Law 2

115–330) is amended— 3

(1) in section 4(a), in the matter preceding 4

paragraph (1), by striking ‘‘the following five years’’ 5

and inserting ‘‘the following 10 years’’; and 6

(2) in section 5(c), in the first sentence, by 7

striking ‘‘the following five years’’ and inserting ‘‘the 8

following 10 years’’. 9

(d) UYGHUR HUMAN RIGHTS POLICY ACT OF 10

2020.—Section 6(h) of the Uyghur Human Rights Policy 11

Act of 2020 (22 U.S.C. 6901 note) is amended by striking 12

‘‘5 years’’ and inserting ‘‘10 years’’. 13

◊ 

VerDate Nov 24 2008 12:44 May 31, 2024 Jkt 000000 PO 00000 Frm 00002 Fmt 6652 Sfmt 6301 C:\USERS\XGSARMIENTO\APPDATA\ROAMING\SOFTQUAD\XMETAL\11.0\GEN\C\MCGO
May 31, 2024 (12:44 p.m.)

G:\M\18\MCGOVE\MCGOVE_060.XML

g:\VHLD\053124\D053124.077.xml           (931602|1)



Amendment to Rules Comm. Print 118–36


Offered by Mr. McGovern of Massachusetts


At the end of subtitle A of title XII, add the following new section:


SEC. 12__. Extension of authorities to impose sanctions under certain laws relating to Hong Kong, Tibet, and the Xinjiang Uyghur autonomous region.

(a) Hong kong human rights and democracy act of 2019.—Section 7(h) of the Hong Kong Human Rights and Democracy Act of 2019 (22 U.S.C. 5701 note) is amended by striking “5 years” and inserting “10 years”.


(b) An act to prohibit the commercial export of covered munitions items to the hong kong police force.—Section 3 of the Act entitled “An Act to prohibit the commercial export of covered munitions items to the Hong Kong Police Force”, approved November 27, 2019 (Public Law 116–77; 133 Stat. 1173), is amended by striking “December 31, 2024” and inserting “December 31, 2029”.


(c) Reciprocal access to tibet act of 2018.—The Reciprocal Access to Tibet Act of 2018 (Public Law 115–330) is amended— 


(1) in section 4(a), in the matter preceding paragraph (1), by striking “the following five years” and inserting “the following 10 years”; and


(2) in section 5(c), in the first sentence, by striking “the following five years” and inserting “the following 10 years”.


(d) Uyghur human rights policy act of 2020.—Section 6(h) of the Uyghur Human Rights Policy Act of 2020 (22 U.S.C. 6901 note) is amended by striking “5 years” and inserting “10 years”.



  
   G:\M\18\MCGOVE\MCGOVE_060.XML XXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXX 5/31/2024 12:44 XXXXXXXXXXX 05/31/2024 12:36 PM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXX   931602|1  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
  
 
  
  
 118th CONGRESS  2d Session 
 Amendment to Rules Comm. Print 118–36 
  
 Offered by  Mr. McGovern of Massachusetts 
  
 
 
    
  At the end of subtitle A of title XII, add the following new section:
 
  12__. Extension of authorities to impose sanctions under certain laws relating to Hong Kong, Tibet, and the Xinjiang Uyghur autonomous region
  (a) Hong kong human rights and democracy act of 2019 Section 7(h) of the Hong Kong Human Rights and Democracy Act of 2019 (22 U.S.C. 5701 note) is amended by striking  5 years and inserting  10 years.
  (b) An act to prohibit the commercial export of covered munitions items to the hong kong police force Section 3 of the Act entitled  An Act to prohibit the commercial export of covered munitions items to the Hong Kong Police Force, approved November 27, 2019 (Public Law 116–77; 133 Stat. 1173), is amended by striking  December 31, 2024 and inserting  December 31, 2029.
  (c) Reciprocal access to tibet act of 2018 The Reciprocal Access to Tibet Act of 2018 (Public Law 115–330) is amended—
  (1) in section 4(a), in the matter preceding paragraph (1), by striking  the following five years and inserting  the following 10 years; and
  (2) in section 5(c), in the first sentence, by striking  the following five years and inserting  the following 10 years.
  (d) Uyghur human rights policy act of 2020 Section 6(h) of the Uyghur Human Rights Policy Act of 2020 (22 U.S.C. 6901 note) is amended by striking  5 years and inserting  10 years.
 

