G:\M\18\GARAME\GARAME_227.XML

AMENDMENT TO
RULES COMMITTEE PRINT 118-36

OFFERED BY MR. GARAMENDI OF CALIFORNIA

At the appropriate place in title XXXI, insert the

following:

1 SEC. 31 . MODIFICATION OF MINOR CONSTRUCTION
THRESHOLD FOR PLANT PROJECTS.

Section 4701(2) of the Atomic Energy Defense Act

(50  U.S.C. 2741(2)) is amended by striking

“$30,000,000” each place it appears and inserting

“$10,000,000”.

AN LN B~ W N

g:\VHLD\052824\D052824.062.xml (92942511)
May 28, 2024 (3:49 p.m.)




Amendment to


Rules Committee Print 118–36


Offered by Mr. Garamendi of California


At the appropriate place in title XXXI, insert the following:


SEC. 31__. Modification of minor construction threshold for plant projects.

Section 4701(2) of the Atomic Energy Defense Act (50 U.S.C. 2741(2)) is amended by striking “$30,000,000” each place it appears and inserting “$10,000,000”.



  
   G:\M\18\GARAME\GARAME_227.XML XXXXXXX XXXXXXX 5/28/2024 15:49 XXXXXXX 05/28/2024 3:46 PM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXX   929425|1  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
  
 
  
  
 118th CONGRESS  2d Session 
 Amendment to 
  
 Rules Committee Print 118–36 
 Offered by  Mr. Garamendi of California 
  
 
 
   
  At the appropriate place in title XXXI, insert the following:
 
  31__. Modification of minor construction threshold for plant projects Section 4701(2) of the Atomic Energy Defense Act (50 U.S.C. 2741(2)) is amended by striking  $30,000,000 each place it appears and inserting  $10,000,000.
 

