G:\M\IO\ELFRET\ELFRET_036. XML

AMENDMENT TO RULES COMMITTEE PRINT 119-8

OFFERED BY MS. ELFRETH OF MARYLAND

At the end of subtitle E of title V add the following

new section:

1 SEC. 5 . MODIFICATION TO MAXIMUM YEARS OF SERV-

2 ICE FOR ELIGIBILITY DETAIL AS A STUDENT

3 AT A LAW SCHOOL.

4 (a) MODIFICATION.—Section 2004(b)(1) of title 10,

5 United States Code, is amended—

6 (1) in subparagraph (A)—

7 (A) in the matter preceding clause (i), by

8 striking  “‘detailed pursuant to subsection

9 (a)(1)” and inserting “with respect to whom

10 the Secretary of a military department is pro-

11 viding funding for educational expenses in ac-

12 cordance with subsection (a)(2)”; and

13 (B) in clause (ii), by striking “eight years”

14 and inserting “10 years”; and

15 (2) in subparagraph (B) in the matter pre-

16 ceding clause (i), by striking “detailed pursuant to

17 subsection (a)(2)” and inserting ‘“‘with respect to

18 whom the Secretary of a military department is not
g:\VHLC\090425\090425.133.xm (101383512)

September 4, 2025 (3:55 p.m.)



G:\M\IO\ELFRET\ELFRET_036. XML

O o0 N N W Bk W =

[\ I \© R \O I O N N e e e e e e T e e
W = O O 0N N R WD = O

2
providing funding for educational expenses in ac-
cordance with subsection (a)(3)”.
(b) TECHNICAL AMENDMENT.—

(1) CORRECTION TO AMENDMENT.—Section
552(a)(2)(B) of the Servicemember Quality of Life
Improvement and National Defense Authorization
Act for Fiscal Year 2025 (Public Law 118-159; 138
Stat. 1894) is amended to read as follows:

“(B) in paragraph (3)(C), by striking ‘pe-
riod of two years for each year or part thereof

)

of his legal training under subsection (a).” and
inserting the following: ‘period of—
“‘(1) two years for each year or part

thereof of legal training under subsection
(a)(2); or

“‘(11) one year for each year or part

thereof of legal training under subsection
(a)(3)..7.

(2) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made
by paragraph (1) shall take effect as if included in
the enactment of the Servicemember Quality of Life
Improvement and National Defense Authorization

Act for Fiscal Year 2025 (Public Law 118-159).

9:\VHLC\090425\090425.133.xml (101383512)

September 4, 2025 (3:55 p.m.)




Amendment to Rules Committee Print 119-8


Offered by Ms. Elfreth of Maryland


At the end of subtitle E of title V add the following new section:


SEC. 5__. Modification to maximum years of service for eligibility detail as a student at a law school.

(a) Modification.—Section 2004(b)(1) of title 10, United States Code, is amended— 


(1) in subparagraph (A)— 


(A) in the matter preceding clause (i), by striking “detailed pursuant to subsection (a)(1)” and inserting “with respect to whom the Secretary of a military department is providing funding for educational expenses in accordance with subsection (a)(2)”; and


(B) in clause (ii), by striking “eight years” and inserting “10 years”; and


(2) in subparagraph (B) in the matter preceding clause (i), by striking “detailed pursuant to subsection (a)(2)” and inserting “with respect to whom the Secretary of a military department is not providing funding for educational expenses in accordance with subsection (a)(3)”.


(b) Technical amendment.— 


(1) CORRECTION TO AMENDMENT.—Section 552(a)(2)(B) of the Servicemember Quality of Life Improvement and National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2025 (Public Law 118‑159; 138 Stat. 1894) is amended to read as follows:


“(B) in paragraph (3)(C), by striking ‘period of two years for each year or part thereof of his legal training under subsection (a).’ and inserting the following: ‘period of— 


“ ‘(i) two years for each year or part thereof of legal training under subsection (a)(2); or


“ ‘(ii) one year for each year or part thereof of legal training under subsection (a)(3).’ .”.


(2) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by paragraph (1) shall take effect as if included in the enactment of the Servicemember Quality of Life Improvement and National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2025 (Public Law 118‑159).



  
   G:\M\19\ELFRET\ELFRET_036.XML XXXXXXX XXXXXXX 9/4/2025 15:54 XXXXXXX 08/26/2025 9:09 AM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXX 
  1013835|2
  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
  
 
  
  
 119th CONGRESS  1st Session 
 Amendment to Rules Committee Print 119-8 
  
 Offered by  Ms. Elfreth of Maryland 
  
 
 
    
  At the end of subtitle E of title V add the following new section: 
  
  5__. Modification to maximum years of service for eligibility detail as a student at a law school 
  (a) Modification Section 2004(b)(1) of title 10, United States Code, is amended— 
  (1) in subparagraph (A)— 
  (A) in the matter preceding clause (i), by striking  detailed pursuant to subsection (a)(1) and inserting  with respect to whom the Secretary of a military department is providing funding for educational expenses in accordance with subsection (a)(2); and 
  (B) in clause (ii), by striking  eight years and inserting  10 years; and 
  (2) in subparagraph (B) in the matter preceding clause (i), by striking  detailed pursuant to subsection (a)(2) and inserting  with respect to whom the Secretary of a military department is not providing funding for educational expenses in accordance with subsection (a)(3). 
  (b) Technical amendment 
  (1) Correction to amendment Section 552(a)(2)(B) of the Servicemember Quality of Life Improvement and National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2025 (Public Law 118‑159; 138 Stat. 1894) is amended to read as follows:
 
  (B) in paragraph (3)(C), by striking  period of two years for each year or part thereof of his legal training under subsection (a). and inserting the following: 
  period of—
  (i) two years for each year or part thereof of legal training under subsection (a)(2); or
  (ii) one year for each year or part thereof of legal training under subsection (a)(3). . . 
  (2) Effective date The amendment made by paragraph (1) shall take effect as if included in the enactment of the Servicemember Quality of Life Improvement and National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2025 (Public Law 118‑159). 
 

