G:\M\I\DOGGET\DOGGET_034. XML

AMENDMENT TO RULES COMMITTEE
PRINT 117-8

OFFERED BY MR. DOGGETT OF TEXAS

In the table contained in section 107(¢), in the row
that relates to project number 1286, in the fifth column,

strike “$10,000,000” and insert “$9,000,000"".

In the table contained in section 107(¢), in the row
that relates to project number 1287, in the fifth column,

strike “$10,000,000” and insert “$9,000,000”.

At the appropriate place in the table contained in
section 107(c) of the bill, add a new item as follows:

(1) In the first column, insert the appropriate
table number (and redesignate accordingly).

(2) In the second column, insert the project
name as “‘Kyle Loop of the Emerald Crown Trail”.

(3) In the third column, insert the city as
“Kyle”.

(4) In the fourth column, insert the State/Terri-
tory as “TX”.

(5) In the fifth column, insert the amount as
“$$2,000,0007.

g:\VHLD\062221\D062221.141.xml (80716611)
June 22, 2021 (5:19 p.m.)




  
   G:\M\17\DOGGET\DOGGET_034.XML  XXXXXXXXX 6/22/2021 17:19 XXXXXXXXX 06/22/2021 5:09 PM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXX   807166|1  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
  
 
  
  
 117th CONGRESS  1st Session 
 Amendment to Rules Committee 
  
 Print 117–8 
 Offered by  Mr. Doggett of Texas 
  
 
 
  
  In the table contained in section 107(c), in the row that relates to project number 1286, in the fifth column, strike  $10,000,000 and insert  $9,000,000.  
  In the table contained in section 107(c), in the row that relates to project number 1287, in the fifth column, strike  $10,000,000 and insert  $9,000,000.    
  At the appropriate place in the table contained in section 107(c) of the bill, add a new item as follows:  
  (1) In the first column, insert the appropriate table number (and redesignate accordingly). 
  (2) In the second column, insert the project name as  Kyle Loop of the Emerald Crown Trail. 
  (3) In the third column, insert the city as  Kyle. 
  (4) In the fourth column, insert the State/Territory as  TX. 
  (5) In the fifth column, insert the amount as  $$2,000,000.  

