G:\M\IS\COURTN\COURTN_065.XML

AMENDMENT TO RULES
COMMITTEE PRINT 118-36

OFFERED BY MR. COURTNEY OF CONNECTICUT

At the end of subtitle E of title VIII, insert the fol-

lowing new section:

[E—

SEC. 8 . PROCUREMENT TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE COOP-
ERATIVE AGREEMENT PROGRAM FUNDS RE-
PROGRAMMING.

Section 4955 of title 10, United States Code, is
amended—
(1) in  subsection (a)(4) by striking
“$1,000,000” and inserting “$1,500,000”; and

(2) by adding at the end the following:

O o0 9 AN U B~ W

“(e) REPROGRAMMING.—Amounts authorized to be

[a—
S

appropriated for any other purpose under this chapter are

[E—
[—

authorized to be transferred only to carry out procurement

[S—
\S)

technical assistance programs under this section.”.

g:\V\G\053024\G053024.033.xml (92982713)
May 30, 2024 (11:01 a.m.)




Amendment to Rules


Committee Print 118–36


Offered by Mr. Courtney of Connecticut


At the end of subtitle E of title VIII, insert the following new section:


SEC. 8__. Procurement technical assistance cooperative agreement program funds reprogramming.

Section 4955 of title 10, United States Code, is amended—


(1) in subsection (a)(4) by striking “$1,000,000” and inserting “$1,500,000”; and


(2) by adding at the end the following:

“(e) Reprogramming.—Amounts authorized to be appropriated for any other purpose under this chapter are authorized to be transferred only to carry out procurement technical assistance programs under this section.”.


  
   G:\M\18\COURTN\COURTN_065.XML XXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXX 5/30/2024 11:01 XXXXXXXXXXXX 05/29/2024 11:13 AM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXX   929827|3  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
  
 
  
  
 118th CONGRESS  2d Session 
 Amendment to Rules 
  
 Committee Print 118–36 
 Offered by  Mr. Courtney of Connecticut 
  
 
 
    
  At the end of subtitle E of title VIII, insert the following new section: 
  
  8__. Procurement technical assistance cooperative agreement program funds reprogramming Section 4955 of title 10, United States Code, is amended— 
  (1) in subsection (a)(4) by striking  $1,000,000 and inserting  $1,500,000; and 
  (2) by adding at the end the following: 
  
  (e) Reprogramming Amounts authorized to be appropriated for any other purpose under this chapter are authorized to be transferred only to carry out procurement technical assistance programs under this section. . 
 

