G\M\IO\BALINT\BALINT_027.XML

AMENDMENT TO THE
SENATE AMENDMENT TO H.R. 1

OFFERED BY MS. BALINT OF VERMONT

In section 71401, in the matter proposed to be
added as section 2105(h)(1)(A)(i) of the Social Security
Act, strike “$10,000,000,000” and insert
“$20,000,000,000".

In section 71401, in the matter proposed to be
added as section 2105(h)(1)(A)(i1) of the Social Security
Act, strike “$10,000,000,000” and insert
“$20,000,000,000".

In section 71401, in the matter proposed to be
added as section 2105(h)(1)(A)(iii) of the Social Security
Act, strike “$10,000,000,000” and insert
“$20,000,000,000".

In section 71401, in the matter proposed to be
added as section 2105(h)(1)(A)(iv) of the Social Security
Act, strike “$10,000,000,000” and insert
“$20,000,000,000".

In section 71401, in the matter proposed to be

added as section 2105(h)(1)(A)(v) of the Social Security

g:\V\G\070125\G070125.057.xml (100125312)
July 1, 2025 (4:52 p.m.)



G:\M\IO\BALINT\BALINT_027.XML
2
Act, strike “$10,000,000,000” and insert
“$20,000,000,000”,

g:\V\G\070125\G070125.057.xml (100125312)
July 1, 2025 (4:52 p.m.)




Amendment to the 


Senate Amendment to H.R. 1


Offered by Ms. Balint of Vermont


In section 71401, in the matter proposed to be added as section 2105(h)(1)(A)(i) of the Social Security Act, strike “$10,000,000,000” and insert “$20,000,000,000”.


In section 71401, in the matter proposed to be added as section 2105(h)(1)(A)(ii) of the Social Security Act, strike “$10,000,000,000” and insert “$20,000,000,000”.


In section 71401, in the matter proposed to be added as section 2105(h)(1)(A)(iii) of the Social Security Act, strike “$10,000,000,000” and insert “$20,000,000,000”.


In section 71401, in the matter proposed to be added as section 2105(h)(1)(A)(iv) of the Social Security Act, strike “$10,000,000,000” and insert “$20,000,000,000”.


In section 71401, in the matter proposed to be added as section 2105(h)(1)(A)(v) of the Social Security Act, strike “$10,000,000,000” and insert “$20,000,000,000”.



  
   G:\M\19\BALINT\BALINT_027.XML XXXXXX XXXXXX 7/1/2025 16:52 XXXXXX 07/01/2025 3:29 PM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXX   1001253|2  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
  
 
  
  
 119th CONGRESS  1st Session 
 Amendment to the  
  
 Senate Amendment to H.R. 1 
 Offered by  Ms. Balint of Vermont 
  
 
 
    
  In section 71401, in the matter proposed to be added as section 2105(h)(1)(A)(i) of the Social Security Act, strike  $10,000,000,000 and insert  $20,000,000,000.  
  In section 71401, in the matter proposed to be added as section 2105(h)(1)(A)(ii) of the Social Security Act, strike  $10,000,000,000 and insert  $20,000,000,000.  
  In section 71401, in the matter proposed to be added as section 2105(h)(1)(A)(iii) of the Social Security Act, strike  $10,000,000,000 and insert  $20,000,000,000.  
  In section 71401, in the matter proposed to be added as section 2105(h)(1)(A)(iv) of the Social Security Act, strike  $10,000,000,000 and insert  $20,000,000,000.  
  In section 71401, in the matter proposed to be added as section 2105(h)(1)(A)(v) of the Social Security Act, strike  $10,000,000,000 and insert  $20,000,000,000. 

