G:\M\18\ARRING\ARRING_140.XML

AMENDMENT TO RULES COMMITTEE PRINT 118-
36

OFFERED BY MR. ARRINGTON OF TEXAS

Add at the end of subtitle C of title XVII the fol-

lowing:

1 SEC.17 .INCREASING PENALTIES FOR BREACH OF MILI-
2 TARY BASE.
3 Section 1382 of title 18, United States Code, is

4 amended by striking “six months’ and inserting “1 year”.

g:\V\E\053024\E053024.109.xml (931298I1)
May 30, 2024 (11:35 p.m.)




Amendment to Rules Committee Print 118-36


Offered by Mr. Arrington of Texas


Add at the end of subtitle C of title XVII the following:


SEC. 17__. Increasing penalties for breach of military base.

Section 1382 of title 18, United States Code, is amended by striking “six months” and inserting “1 year”. 



  
   G:\M\18\ARRING\ARRING_140.XML XXXXXXXX XXXXXXXX 5/30/2024 23:35 XXXXXXXX 05/30/2024 11:32 PM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXX   931298|1  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
  
 
  
  
 118th CONGRESS  2d Session 
 Amendment to Rules Committee Print 118-36 
  
 Offered by  Mr. Arrington of Texas 
  
 
 
    
  Add at the end of subtitle C of title XVII the following: 
  
  17__. Increasing penalties for breach of military base Section 1382 of title 18, United States Code, is amended by striking  six months and inserting  1 year.   
 

