FAM13\CONNOL\CONNOL_107.XML

AMENDMENT TO THE RULES COMMITTEE PRINT
FOR H.R. 4435

OFFERED BY MR. CONNOLLY OF VIRGINIA
At the end of title XI, add the following:

1 SEC. 1107. EXTENSION OF PART-TIME REEMPLOYMENT AU-
THORITY.
(a) CSRS.—Section 8344(1)(7) of title 5, United
States Code, is amended by strike “5 years” and inserting
“10 years”.

(b) FERS.—Section 8468(1)(7) of such title is

~N O D kAW

amended by striking “5 years” and inserting “10 years”.

fA\VHLC\051914\051914.226.xml (57489514)
May 19, 2014 (2:09 p.m.)



